
Bid Tabulation
Supply and /or Delivery of Asphalt Concrete Rock Dirt Sand 

November 30, 2023

Line No. Material Description Qty Unit
 Price Per 

Ton/CY FOB 
your yard you 

load our trucks  

 Delivery 
Charge 15 to 

100 TONS/CY 
to City Site 

 Delivery 
Charge 100+ 
TONS/CY to 

City site 

 Bidder 
Comments  

 Price Per 
Ton/CY FOB 
your yard you 

load our trucks  

 Delivery 
Charge 15 to 

100 TONS/CY 
to City Site 

 Delivery Charge 
100+ TONS/CY 

to City site 
 Bidder Comments  

 Price Per 
Ton/CY FOB 
your yard you 

load our trucks  

 Delivery 
Charge 15 to 

100 TONS/CY 
to City Site 

 Delivery Charge 
100+ TONS/CY 

to City site 
 Bidder Comments  

 Price Per 
Ton/CY FOB 
your yard you 

load our trucks  

 Delivery 
Charge 15 to 

100 TONS/CY 
to City Site 

 Delivery 
Charge 100+ 
TONS/CY to 

City site 

 Bidder 
Comments  

1 Cold Mix Temp Patch Material 330 TN No Bid 145.00$            15.00$              15.00$                 No Bid 145.00$            15.00$              15.00$              

2 Asphalt Concrete Mag Spec 710  3/4" 1,000 TN No Bid 96.00$              16.00$              16.00$                 No Bid 101.00$            15.00$              15.00$              

3 Asphalt Concrete Mag Spec 710  1/2" 2,000 TN No Bid 98.00$              16.00$              16.00$                 No Bid 103.00$            15.00$              15.00$              

4 Asphalt Concrete with Fiber MAG SPEC 326 3/4" 200 TN No Bid 110.00$            16.00$              16.00$                 No Bid 116.00$            15.00$              15.00$              

5 Asphalt Concrete with Fiber MAG SPEC 326 1/2" 200 TN No Bid 113.00$            16.00$              16.00$                 No Bid 118.00$            15.00$              15.00$              

6 Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement (RAP) MAG Spec 710 1/2" 200 TN No Bid 96.00$              16.00$              16.00$                 No Bid 118.00$            15.00$              15.00$              

7 Reclaimed Asphalt Pavement (RAP) MAG Spec 710 3/4" 200 TN No Bid 94.00$              16.00$              16.00$                 No Bid 116.00$            15.00$              15.00$              

8 Start Up Fee  (If called upon vendor will need to 
start-up if asked, unless equipment is down)                 Under 100 Tons

1,800.00$         2,500.00$         

9 Sack Slurry MAG  Spec 728 1/2 sack 90 CY No Bid 125.00$            No Bid No Bid 

10 Sack Slurry MAG  Spec 728 1-sack 140 CY No Bid 135.00$            No Bid No Bid 

11 Sack Slurry MAG  Spec 728 2-sack 30 CY No Bid 145.00$            No Bid No Bid 

12 3000PSI Concrete with Air MAG 725 - Class A Provide mix design 130 CY No Bid 180.00$            No Bid No Bid 

13 3000PSI Concrete without Air Concrete - Provide Mix design 100 CY No Bid 180.00$            No Bid No Bid 

14 4000PSI Concrete with air MAG 725 - Class AA Provide mix design 85 CY No Bid 190.00$            No Bid No Bid 

15 4000PSI Concrete with air Concrete - Provide Mix Design 50 CY No Bid 190.00$            No Bid No Bid 

16 Bedding Material 3/8 minus with less than 2% organic material, less than 1.5% Swell Factor 420 TN 19.00$              N/A  FOB 20.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 17.95$              -$                  -$                     No Bid 

17 Decorative Rock Your Product - Describe sizes and color to be included with bid 35.00$              N/A  FOB 42.95$              -$                  -$                      See info in Bid 
Submital  No Bid 

18 Decorative Rock 32.75$              N/A  FOB 42.95$              -$                  -$                     No Bid 

19 Driveway Rock 3/4 minus all colors (note size change from 3/8) 225 TN 24.00$              N/A  FOB 25.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 35.50$              -$                  -$                     No Bid 

20 MAG 702 Spec Select Material Type A 19.00$              N/A  FOB 20.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 No Bid No Bid 

21 MAG 702 Spec Select Material Type B 19.00$              N/A  FOB 20.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 No Bid No Bid 

22 MAG 702 Spec Aggregate Base 23.00$              N/A  FOB 25.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 34.50$              -$                  -$                     No Bid 

23 Non-Spec ABC
Select Material  1.5 inch minus

Bidder to supply material characteristics with bid (e.g., gradation, swell factor, 
plasticity)   3/4" ABC

500 TN 18.00$              N/A  FOB 20.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 No Bid No Bid 

24 Non-Spec ABC 
Select Material 1.25 inch minus

Bidder to supply material characteristics with bid (e.g., gradation, swell factor, 
plasticity)

500 TN 18.00$              N/A  FOB 20.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 20.95$              5.00$                5.00$                   No Bid 

25 Pea Gravel 3/8 to 3/16 washed 275 TN 25.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 33.50$              -$                  -$                     No Bid 

26 Rip-Rap MAG 703 3inch 30.00$              N/A  FOB 43.95$              -$                  -$                     No Bid 

27 Rip-Rap MAG 703 4-8inch 35.00$              N/A  FOB 43.95$              -$                  -$                     No Bid 

28 Rip-Rap MAG 703 8-12inch 40.00$              N/A  FOB 43.95$              -$                  -$                     

29 Rock Leach Rock, 1 to 3 inch with 30% minimum voids when placed 50 TN 23.00$              N/A  FOB 26.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 28.95$              -$                  -$                     No Bid 

30
Sand/Concrete

Washed sand # 4 to 200 sieve. Show various sand and list characteristics to 
include masonry, concrete and plaster sand to be included with bid. 

50 TN 35.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 35.50$              -$                  -$                     No Bid 

31 Sand Asphalt Sand 35.00$              10.00$              10.00$                 No Bid No Bid 
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