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1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part Number No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

4
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part Number No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part Number No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

7 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part Number No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

8
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

9
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 22%  $   13,824.00 No Bid 10% TBD
11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 22%  $     9,106.00 No Bid 10% TBD
13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

18 44% Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

19 44%  $    7,236.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 13%  $     7,236.00 No Bid 10% TBD
20 44%  $    2,522.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
21 44%  $    6,363.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
22 47%  $  20,817.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 22%  $   20,817.00 No Bid 10% TBD
23 44%  $    3,499.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 14%  $     3,499.00 No Bid 10% TBD
24 47%  $  21,758.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 22%  $   21,758.00 No Bid 10% TBD
25 47%  $  12,813.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 22%  $   12,813.00 No Bid 10% TBD
26 44%  $    6,542.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 14%  $     9,627.00 No Bid 10% TBD
27 49%  $    4,460.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40%  $     5,114.00 5% 20%  $     4,073.00 No Bid 10% TBD
28 49%  $    4,662.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40%  $     5,012.00 5% 20%  $     4,997.00 No Bid 10% TBD
29 52%  $  23,854.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40%  $   23,854.00 5% 20%  $   23,818.00 No Bid 10% TBD
30 52%  $  17,058.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40%  $   17,354.00 5% 20%  $   17,311.00 No Bid 10% TBD

31 20% Invalid Part
Number

TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%  $     7,300.00 5% 20%  $   10,047.00 No Bid 10% TBD

32
25%  Specialty

Item
TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

33 20%  $    7,250.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%  $     7,350.00 5% 20%  $   10,146.00 No Bid 10% TBD

34 20% Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

35 25%
 Specialty
Item

TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

36 20%
Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%  $   10,440.00 5% 20%  $   13,702.00 No Bid 10% TBD

37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     22,470.00 N/A No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     28,876.00 N/A No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

Fairbanks Morse
Fairbanks Morse
Fairbanks Morse

Gould

Pump Manufacture

AMW Industries
AMW Industries

Aurora

Aurora

Aurora

Aurora

Aurora

Aurora

Aurora

Berkley
Berkley
Berkley
Crane-Demming

Goulds
Grundfos
Grundfos

3656M
3656
Vertical Multi-Stage
CR4-80 UGAAUUE
CR4-60-U-G-A-AUUE

Grundfos
Grundfos

Paco

Paco

Paco

CR90-3-2
CR45-3-2AGAE-KUBE

?

29-4095C-1F0001-7931

S0035690 B

Paco

Paco

Peerless
Peerless

29-40122-X49008

SOO 14337B

5AEF8N
5AEF8N

2824A

SST

Weinman
Weinman

321BF

B2 1/2-ZPLS
B2ZPLS
B1.5ZPLS
421120800710

Gould
Gould
Gould
Gould
Goulds

Deming

Pentair
Pentair
Pentair-Aurora
Pentair-Aurora
Teel

2876C

Goulds
Goulds

19-2556167-1
411 LFC

Pump Model Number

4AE
2K

411-BF

344A BF

4B1-BF

481BF

344A-BF

Pump Serial Number

146246-1
134331-2

97-11128-2

97-13428-2

97-66677

60584801

15-2443600
15-2443608-1
?

44-13

?

Paco

T1269000
5353

Wastewater Pumps

5BF1N2AOPE
2SVBK6
SSH 4SH1K5C0
18BF2Q5K0
HSC20C30

DC882194
2823C
1923A

A96419122-P10744062

H0664394
MO505672
M9915151
16BF1S5B0
16BF1Q50

50014337A

946097TF
9460972F
10275036

S0014445B

01R80255A01

16-30957-14101-1881

C41007066-P1-9745
A98405761P1130903

91-08166-1

91-66187

96-14733-1

97-15530-2

BM-B-54094

13-2307960-1
K3P1017551

2486959

H1161587
H0158564

992515
R063088
DC-845156-PUMP
43602084140
1828688-3

155V4GH14F60-M01
D41006068-P1-0120

Hennesy Mechanical SalesBMP PHXPotable Water Pumps

Phoenix Pumps BMP PHX Hennesy Mechanical Sales

Phoenix Pumps James, Cooke & Hobson, Inc. Tech-Flow, LLC

James, Cooke & Hobson, Inc. Tech-Flow, LLC

KP Ventures Well Drilling & Scott's Arizona Electrical

KP Ventures Well Drilling & Scott's Arizona Electrical
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46
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Not a valid

model
number

Not a valid model
number

Not a valid model
number

No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%  $     5,897.00 5% 2%  $     5,897.00 No Bid 10% TBD
48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%  $     8,847.00 5% 2%  $     8,847.00 No Bid 10% TBD
49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%  $     9,100.00 5% 2%  $     9,100.00 No Bid 10% TBD
52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%  $   12,721.00 5% 2%  $   12,721.00 No Bid 10% TBD
54 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 30%  $   12,793.00 5% 2%  $   12,793.00 No Bid 10% TBD
57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40%  $   55,000.00 5% 20%  $   56,818.00 No Bid 10% TBD
58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0%  $     16,028.00 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     16,401.00  $              1,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     15,231.00  $              1,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     33,676.00  $              2,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     53,308.00  $              2,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     53,457.00  $              1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     12,491.00  $              1,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     16,401.00  $              1,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     15,231.00  $              1,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     22,849.00  $              2,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     28,575.00  $              2,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

77
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     18,400.00  $              2,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

79
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

80
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

81
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

82 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     18,241.00  $              1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

83
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

84
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

85
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Not a valid

model
number

Not a valid
model number

Not a valid model
number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     11,239.00  $              1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

87
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

88
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Not a valid

model
number

Not a valid
model number

Not a valid model
number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $       5,475.00  $              1,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     10,419.00  $              1,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

Aurora 405VP

Barnes 3SE2024HD
Barnes 4SE3724L

Pump Manufacture Pump Model Number Pump Serial Number

Barnes SGV5032L
Barnes 4XSE20046EHA

Barnes 4SEHL-1002
Barnes 4SEH-1002

Barnes 4SEU15044L
Barnes 4SE15034L

Barnes 4SE15044HL
Barnes SGV3022L

CCB Sample PUMP
Eclipse EH25NBVO-X AF1042123-1/2

Barnes 4XSHDI60044
Borger HPL-200 28105164

Fairbanks U066D2324C2X1H31A
Fairbanks Morse 19B-7100AW 2363767-00-01

Fairbanks D5434M
Fairbanks B5424

Flygt NP-3127X-489
Flygt NP-3127-489

Fairbanks Morse 12M-7100AW 2363790-00-01
Fairbanks Morse 6D-7100AW 2363794-00

Flygt PP-4660
Flygt FP-3102-491

Flygt 4650
Flygt 4660

Flygt 3153.181-1260498
Flygt 3153.185-1230002

Flygt NP-3127X-489 52-PMP-101/102
Flygt 3127.060-2030424

Flygt CP3127X-485

Flygt CP3152-269

Flygt CP3067.180

Flygt 6020.091-2270010

Flygt CP3300-181

Flygt CP3127.090

Flygt CP3127.070-2180095

3085.172-0860018
Flygt 3102.060-2160234

3152.181-0810110

Flygt 3102.170-091

Flygt MP3127.890-5060

Flygt 3127.170-0447

Flygt

Flygt CP3085.182-0260702

Flygt
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BID TABULATION Submersible and Non-Submersible Pumps,
Motors Parts, and Repairs

91
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

92
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Not a valid

model
number

Not a valid
model number

Not a valid model
number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

93
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

94
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

Item
#

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current Catalog
Pricing *

Estimated Expedited
Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

95
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

96
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

97
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     12,508.00  $              2,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     29,858.00  $              2,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5%  $     16,776.00  $              1,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
101 33%  $    6,676.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
102 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20%  $   58,312.00 No Bid 10% TBD
103 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20%  $   58,312.00 No Bid 10% TBD
104 42%  $    9,910.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

105 42% Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

106 42%  $  12,700.00 TBD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

107 42% Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

108 42% Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

109 42% Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

110 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
111 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
112 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
113 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
114 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
115 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
116 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
117 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
118 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
119 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
121 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
122 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
123 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
124 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
125 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
126 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
127 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
128 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
129 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

130 0% Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

131 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

132 20% Invalid Part
Number

Invalid Part
Number

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

133 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
134 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
135 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

Flygt 3127.180-8031

Flygt 3140.180-5083

Flygt 3102.180-0972

Flygt 3127.180-4720

Pump Manufacture Pump Model Number Pump Serial Number

Wastewater Pumps Continued

Flygt (RAS) NT-3153-625 3153.185-1350071
Flygt (WAS) NT-3127-489 3127.185-1350032/3

Flygt CP3152.181-0193

Flygt 6020.181-2130025

Hayword Gordon 12-PMP2-203 XR4(12) HG328516-2
Hydromatic HPGH300M2-2

Grundfos MTR20-16/6
Hayword Gordon 12-PMP1-103 XR4(12) HG328516-1

Meyers 3RH50M2-21

Meyers 4VC200M4-43
Meyers 4VHX30M6-23

Hydromatic HPGR200

Hydromatic 554F300M-4-81

Hydromatic S4F300M3-4

Hydromatic HPGF500

Meyers WG50H-21-25
Meyers WG50-21-25

Hydromatic 48E15034L

Meyers 4VH10014-23

Pentair 1822B (4”) 18-2528550
Pentair 411N LFC (6X8X11HH) 19-2568644

Meyers 4WHV30M4-23
Meyers WHRH20-21C

Meyers 4VX53M4-21
Meyers 4V30M6-23

Moyno ANNIHILATOR M06F4 CEA11C11C
Moyno BM813-8100

Meyers 4RH150M2-43
Moyno PROGRESSIVE CAVITY 1WB115CDQ3SA1ATAD

OSHG WATER/BRINE PUMP

Paco P25G2706F-YH

Moyno 3911000031 3403932707

Neptune 106185 85069113

Pentair Fairbanks Nkuhuis 7100AW 10670341

Meyers WG30H-23-25
Meyers WGX50H-21-25

Meyers 4VH75M4-23
Meyers WG50H-23-25

Meyers 4WHV50M4-21

Flygt CP3152.181-0560073

Flygt 3102.080-972

Phoenix Pumps BMP PHX Hennesy Mechanical Sales James, Cooke & Hobson, Inc. Tech-Flow, LLC KP Ventures Well Drilling & Scott's Arizona Electrical

February 15, 2024



BID TABULATION Submersible and Non-Submersible Pumps,
Motors Parts, and Repairs

136 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
137 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
138 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
139 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net +30% Net +30% Net +30% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
140 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20%  $   26,765.00 No Bid 10% TBD
141 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

142
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pump no

longer
available

Pump no longer
available

Pump no longer
available

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

Item
# Motor Model Motor Serial

Number Motor HP Motor
Voltage

Motor
Phase Motor FLA Motor

Frame
% off

Catalog
Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current Catalog
Pricing *

Estimated Expedited
Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate
143 JML1409T F1109231404 5 230 1 ? L 184 JM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 70%  $     2,510.00 10% 62%  $     2,468.00 No Bid 10% TBD
144 1103007448 1V322 2 230 1 13.5 56 J No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
145 UT-4TE B564/N04N058R055F 30 460 3 35.8 286JM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% 12%  $     6,118.00 No Bid 10% TBD

146 G79809-E3E310473R-1 75 460 3 85.5 354TS
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

147 F1194 JMM3613T 5 460 3 6 184JM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 70%  $     2,468.00 10% 48%  $     2,032.00 No Bid 10% TBD
148 G80765 X04X0590857R-1 60 460 3 72 326TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
149 JMM2534T 525 30 460 3 39 284JM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $     7,015.00 10% 55%  $     7,015.00 No Bid 10% TBD

150
36K577-
036161 84Z04030 3 230 1 14 182TC

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

151 M2550T A2F098W408H1 100 460 3 111 365TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% 15%  $   13,952.00 No Bid 10% TBD
152 39L058W903G1 20 460 3 24 254TCZ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% 20%  $     4,687.00 No Bid 10% TBD

153 F206-A03A015R124M 40 460 3 48 324TB
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

154 121-300-7401 3 230 1 12.3 56J No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
155 EJMM2534T 21109210081 30 460 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% 54%  $     7,015.00 No Bid 10% TBD
156 R217A A09A160R377M 15 460 3 19 215T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% 10%  $     2,103.00 No Bid 10% TBD
157 75 460 3 82 364TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
158 R1 P08-30715118-6T-02 75 460 3 365T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
159 Reliance 1204507086-000010 50 460 3 326JM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
160 EM2554T4 44E194W324 125 460 3 404TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $   17,509.00 10% 44%  $   17,509.00 No Bid 10% TBD
161 M2554T-4 44E059W058H1 125 460 3 140 404TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $   17,509.00 10% 44%  $   17,509.00 No Bid 10% TBD
162 JMM2516T 39K062X103 25 460 3 256JM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $     5,925.00 10% 59%  $     5,925.00 No Bid 10% TBD
163 3069292 60 460 3 70 326TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
164 Reliance 1204507086-000020 30 460 3 286JM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% 41%  $     9,541.00 No Bid 10% TBD
165 Reliance 37A003Y216G4 7.5 460 3 213TC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
166 E877 S02R354R010F 15 460 3 18.5 215JPZ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
167 Reliance EM2514T 20 460 3 24.4 254T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $     3,955.00 10% 42%  $     3,955.00 No Bid 10% TBD

168 H007T10T206R045M 75 460 3 89 364TS
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% 12%  $   13,051.00 No Bid 10% TBD

169 E830A Y11Y261K35F 25 460 3 31 256T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% 10%  $     3,327.00 No Bid 10% TBD
170 F597 84-Z00029 3 230 1 16 182TC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

171
5KC49TN2141
X L07J170009 2 230 1 12.6 56C

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

172 8C89
4VN184TBFR7305AN
L 5 230 1 22.4 184TCZ

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

173 84Z05656 C1301250417 50 460 3 326TSCZ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
174 JMM2546T 404 60 460 3 70 326JM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $   11,683.00 10% 49%  $   11,683.00 No Bid 10% TBD

175 12719608-100 12719608-0001M0002 75 460 3 365T
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

176 84Z03374 Z0709211091 20 460 3 24 254TC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
177 JMM3709T 37M31X75 7.5 460 3 9.4 213JM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $     2,427.00 10% 48%  $     2,427.00 No Bid 10% TBD
178 JPM4104T C0606060197 30 460 3 38 286JP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $     9,541.00 10% 48%  $     9,541.00 No Bid 10% TBD

179 H125V1CS-P
A0420182508-
001R0001 125 460 3 444TS

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

180 EJMM3212T 5 460 3 182JM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $     1,864.00 10% 47%  $     1,864.00 No Bid 10% TBD
181 X0605 M2A96558903-001 15 460 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

182 BTA5-9-F2
B081AV07V162R039
F 10 460 3 12.2 215JM

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

183 Super E EM4107T-G 25 460 3 284TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $     5,943.00 10% 32%  $     6,564.00 No Bid 10% TBD
184 Super E EM4114T-G 50 460 3 326TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $   11,337.00 10% 47%  $   11,337.00 No Bid 10% TBD

185 TDS
SD404TSTDS7026HN
W 100 460 3 119 404TS

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

2363767-1

201 10637/B71686

Pentair Fairbanks Nkuhuis 2363794-0
Simflow SM10M-5 203988  1/2

Pentair Fairbanks Nkuhuis 2363790-1
Pentair Fairbanks Nkuhuis 2363790-0

Pentair Fairbanks Nkuhuis

Phoenix PumpsPotable Water Motors BMP PHX Hennesy Mechanical Sales

H33A-9711190-001

Simflow 93140A399

Wetzsch NM063SY02S14K

James, Cooke & Hobson, Inc. Tech-Flow, LLC KP Ventures Well Drilling & Scott's Arizona Electrical

February 15, 2024



BID TABULATION Submersible and Non-Submersible Pumps,
Motors Parts, and Repairs

Item
# Motor Model Motor Serial

Number Motor HP Motor
Voltage

Motor
Phase Motor FLA Motor

Frame
% off

Catalog
Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current Catalog
Pricing *

Estimated Expedited
Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate

% off
Catalog

Current
Catalog

Pricing *

Estimated
Expedited

Shipping Rate
186 7320-BEH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
187 BALDOR 15 460 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
188 BALDOR F1310153089 3 230/460 3 8.4/4.2 182TC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD
189 BALDOR Z0710020611 30 230/460 3 66/33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20%  $     7,061.00 No Bid 10% TBD
190 BALDOR 05F989W81161 0.75 460 3 1.1 56C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

191
BALDOR
0105915040-
000010

X1308M41725/7 1 230/460 3 2.9/1.45 143TC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12%  $     1,675.00 No Bid 10% TBD

192
BALDOR
0105962697-
000010

X1309M43255 1.5 208-
230/460

3 4.6-4.2/2.1 TEFC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

193
BALDOR
1OH297Z1646
1

C1308140642 25 460 3 29 284T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 22%  $     5,345.00 No Bid 10% TBD

194
BALDOR A44-
465304936

A1309032046 350 460 3 373 449TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6%  $ 104,553.00 No Bid 10% TBD

195
BALDOR A44-
4705-2814

A1309032064 200 160 3 216 447TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6%  $   38,558.00 No Bid 10% TBD

196
BALDOR CD-
20136

W1310292578 0.5 208-
230/460

3 2.1-2/1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12%  $     1,184.00 No Bid 10% TBD

197
BALDOR
EM4108T

09F629Y356G1 30 230/460 3 66/33 286TS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $     7,061.00 10% 37%  $     7,061.00 No Bid 10% TBD

198
BALDOR
JMM2546T

42F039V283 60 230/460 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60%  $   11,683.00 10% 48%  $   11,683.00 No Bid 10% TBD

199 GEA 5390-8896-389 125 460 3 139 444/5T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

200
LEESON
C42D17FK1C

98000 ½ 90 3 5 N8856C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

201

NEMA
PREMUIM
GR3-CI-TP-
364T-4-BR-D-
60

9133615 60 260/460 3 138.8/69.4 364T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

202 NORD 3 230/460 3 9 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

203

NORD TYPE
SK 100LH/4
CUS
BRE40RGTWS
H

201185389-100 /
18346843

3 230/460 3 8.60/4.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

204
US MOTOR
6205-J/C3

422696-009 5 230/460 3 12.7/6.4 184TC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

205 US MOTORS C02-8328A-M A5 50 230/460 3 116/58 326TP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

206

US MOTORS
(NIDEC)
D125PFS/DC9
7

A 08 7718668-0059 M
0001

125 460 3 136 ODP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

207
US MOTORS
(NIDEC) DC78

Y 12 7684127-0015 M
0002

75 230/460 3 171.0/86.0 ODP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

208
US MOTORS
13701643-100

U 12 13701643-0001
M 0002

75 460 3 86 365VP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

209
US MOTORS
137018XXX

U 1 13701643-0001 M
0002

75 460 3 86 365VP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

210
US MOTORS
6218-J/C3

U 12 20130705-0001 R
0001

150 460 3 178 447VP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

211
US MOTORS
C63JXGWU-
1114

3-Jan 110/220-
230

1 6.8/3.2-3.4 56J No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

212
US MOTORS
HO50P2BLG/F
C83

B 07 7743969-0026 M
0002

50 230/460 3 131.0/65.0 WPI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20%  $     8,437.00 No Bid 10% TBD

Wastewater Motors and Parts Phoenix Pumps BMP PHX Hennesy Mechanical Sales James, Cooke & Hobson, Inc. Tech-Flow, LLC KP Ventures Well Drilling & Scott's Arizona Electrical

February 15, 2024



BID TABULATION Submersible and Non-Submersible Pumps,
Motors Parts, and Repairs

213
US MOTORS
NIDEC
13701644-1

U 12 13701644-0001
M 0001

7.5 460 3 9.2 TY14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

214
US MOTORS
P63FZW-4416

¾ 208-
230/460

3 2.7-2.8/1.4 56J No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

215
WEG
02018EP3E256
T

20MA108 1001518645 20 460 3 23.7-48.6 256T No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% TBD

15

Scott's Arizona Electrical Motor Repair PM, LLC dba PumpMan Phoenix
On-Site Non-Emergency Pump Repair

Pump Manufacture Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material
PumpMan Phoenix $131.25 $131.25 18%

Simflo $131.25 $131.25 18%

KP Ventures Well Drilling & Pump Co, LLC
On-Site Non-Emergency Pump Repair

Pump Manufacture Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material %
All Brands that we gave pricing for $150 $90 5%

20%
20%
20%
20%

25%
25%
25%
25%Teco $175/hour $175/hour

Baldor $175/hour $175/hour
US Motor $175/hour $175/hour

Burks $175/hour $175/hour

Barnes $175/hour $175/hour 25%
Deming $175/hour $175/hour 25%
Simflo $175/hour $175/hour 25%

Paco $175/hour $175/hour 25%
Crane $175/hour $175/hour 25%

Weirman $175/hour $175/hour 25%

On-Site Emergency Pump Repair
Pump Manufacture Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material

Grundfos $175/hour $175/hour 25%

Teco $125/hour $125/hour

Baldor $125/hour $125/hour
US Motor $125/hour $125/hour

Burks $125/hour $125/hour

Barnes $125/hour $125/hour 20%
Deming $125/hour $125/hour 20%
Simflo $125/hour $125/hour 20%

Paco $125/hour $125/hour 20%
Crane $125/hour $125/hour 20%

Weirman $125/hour $125/hour 20%

Tech-Flow, LLC
On-Site Non-Emergency Pump Repair

Pump Manufacture Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material
Grundfos $125/hour $125/hour 20%

0%
0%
0%
0%
0%
0%

0%
0%
0%
0%
0%
0%
0%Netzsch $250/hour $165/hour

Aurora $250/hour $165/hour
Pulsafeeder $250/hour $165/hour

Sanitaire $250/hour $165/hour

Flygt $250/hour $165/hour
Netzsch $250/hour $165/hour

Gardner Denver $250/hour $165/hour

On-Site Emergency Pump Repair
Pump Manufacture Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material %

$165/hour $135/hour
Netzsch $165/hour $135/hour

James, Cooke & Hobson, Inc.
On-Site Non-Emergency Pump Repair

Pump Manufacture Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material %
Flygt $165/hour $135/hour 0%

Netzsch $165/hour $135/hour
Gardner Denver $165/hour $135/hour

Aurora $165/hour $135/hour
Pulsafeeder $165/hour $135/hour

Sanitaire

Additional Material
15

Additional Material

Service Center Fabricator/Welder $120.00 per Hour $95.00 per Hour 25%

Pump Manufacture

Field Service Technician

Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material %

$160.00 per Hour (per tech) $95.00 per Hour (per Tech) 25%

Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material %
Service Center Technician $240.00 per Hour $190.00 per Hour 25%

On-Site Emergency Pump Repair

Field Service Technician Non-Business Hours $240.00 per Hour (per tech) $195.00 per Hour (per Tech) 25%
Field Service - Emergencies $320.00 per Hour (per tech) $285.00 per Hour (per Tech) 25%

Service Center Machinist $300.00 per Hour $190.00 per Hour 25%
Service Center Fabricator/Welder $240.00 per Hour $190.00 per Hour 25%

Pump Manufacture

$150.00 per Hour $95.00 per Hour 25%
Service Center Repair Technician $120.00 per Hour $95.00 per Hour 25%

Service Center Machinist

Pump Manufacture

On-Site Emergency Pump Repair
Pump Manufacture Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate

BMP PHX LLC 202

Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate
BMP PHX LLC 135 135

202

On-Site Non-Emergency Pump RepairOn-Site Non-Emergency Pump Repair
Phoenix Pumps BMP PHX

February 15, 2024



BID TABULATION Submersible and Non-Submersible Pumps,
Motors Parts, and Repairs

PumpMan Phoenix $131.25 $131.25 18%
Simflo $131.25 $131.25 18%

On-Site Emergency Pump Repair
Pump Manufacture Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material

On-Site Emergency Pump Repair
Pump Manufacture Pump Technician Hourly Rate Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material %

All Brands that we gave pricing for $200 $125 5%

Pump Technician Hourly Rate
135
135
135
135
135

On-Site Non-Emergency Pump Repair
Pump Manufacture Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material %

FAIRBANKS 55 No Bid
MOYNO 55 No Bid
MEYERS 55 No Bid

PEERLESS 55 No Bid
PENTAIR 55 No Bid

MOYNO

On-Site Emergency Pump Repair
Pump Manufacture Laborer Hourly Rate Additional Material %

FAIRBANKS 75 No Bid
Pump Technician Hourly Rate

165
No Bid

MEYERS 75 No Bid
PEERLESS 75 No Bid

165
165
165

PENTAIR 75 No Bid165

Hennesy Mechanical Sales

75

February 15, 2024


